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Holiday Greetings 
 

               
Wishing you the beauty of hope, the 
warmth of love during this Holiday Season 
and always.                   
 
Usha & Babu Venkataraghavan 
 
 

 
 

Legendary Singer Saavitri Ramanand 
 
 
 
 
 

  

  

 

                            
 

 
 
Kundun, Marah and Autumn Danced for a 

good Cause 
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We had the most number of 
participants at this year’s Fundraiser 
Luncheon held on 26 September 
2008. All warmly welcomed the 
honorees, enjoyed the exhilarating 
music of Saavitri Ramanand and the 
delightful dance performance of 
three youngsters from Trilok Fusion 
Arts, based in Brooklyn, NY. Our 
supporters were inspired by speeches 
given by New York State’s OMRDD 
commissioner, Diana Jones Ritter and 
New York State Assembly Member, 
James Brennan. Everyone Present 
was touched by consumer Ike 
Shreves’s extraordinary attempts in 
collecting monies for his pen pals in 
India. 

To view additional photos please visit 
us at www.friendsofasha.com 

 

We Appreciate your Support 

 
 

 

 

       
Let The Diwali Celebrations Begin 

 

   
Families Gathering to Meet Usha 

 
 
 

 

 
 

Your Generosity Made 
it Possible 

 
 
 
 
 
 
Newly Renovated Prayer Hall 


